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Base Year: October 6, 2020 - October 5, 2021
1 Lump Sum PRICE 3,550.00 8,781.00 10,500.00 NO BID
Environmental Laboratory Audit Services TOTAL 3,550.00 8,781.00 10,500.00
Extension 1: October 6, 2021 - October 5, 2022
1 Lump Sum PRICE 3,650.00 8,781.00 10,500.00 NO BID
Environmental Laboratory Audit Services TOTAL 3,650.00 8,781.00 10,500.00
Extension 2: October 6, 2022 - October 5, 2023
1 Lump Sum PRICE 3,750.00 8,781.00 10,500.00 NO BID
Environmental Laboratory Audit Services TOTAL 3,750.00 8,781.00 10,500.00
Extension 3: October 6, 2023 - October 5, 2024
1 Lump Sum PRICE 3,850.00 8,781.00 10,500.00 NO BID
Environmental Laboratory Audit Services TOTAL 3,850.00 8,781.00 10,500.00
Extension 4: October 6, 2024 - October 5, 2025
1 Lump Sum PRICE 3,950.00 8,781.00 10,500.00 NO BID
Environmental Laboratory Audit Services TOTAL 3,950.00 8,781.00 10,500.00
%
GRAND TOTAL (BASE, EXT 1, EXT 2, EXT 3 AND EXT 4 [TOTAL 18,750.00 43,905.00 52,500.00
Net Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days
Delivery Days
*LOW BIDDER
BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
A2LA Work Place Training LabWare Demandstar
Advanced Systems LDCFL-NAOS Consulting SAWS Website

Analytical Excellence

Quality Assurance Solutions




ChemVal Consulting SAW Env.
Dynamic Technology Solutions Shepherd Technical Serv.
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